RESOLUTION NO. 2012-3

WHEREAS, the Board of Supervisors of the Township of Tulpehocken, Berks County,
Pennsylvania,

NOW, THEREFORE, the Board of Supervisors of the Township of Tulpehocken, Berks
County, Pennsylvania, hereby Resolves as follows:

To award contract(s) for the purchase of the following items through Berks County Joint

Purchasing: See attached Fuel Bid Tally Sheets

ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of Tulpehocken Township this | 3+h day of

February, 2012.

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF TULPEHOCKEN
TOWNSHIP, BERKS COUNTY, PENNSYLVANIA

Attest: %Cbbé“/ ﬁb{ﬂ(

Secretary,




BERKS COUNTY JOINT PURCHASING BOARD

7/1/12 - 06/30/13 FUEL BID TALLY SHEET - Open and Award January 12,2012

VENDOR Talley Petroleum Enterprises, Inc.
FIRM OPIS + Weekly
o Harrisburg

BRAND - GASOLINE Global, Sunoco
TRANSPORT Unleaded Octane 87 2.8665 * 0.0595
TRANSPORT Unleaded Octane 89 2.9365 * 0.0595
TRANSPORT Unleaded Octane 92 No Bid 0.0595
Tank Wagon Unleaded Octane 87 3.0375 * 0.1995
Tank Wagon Unleaded Octane 89 3.1275 * 0.1995

Tank Wagon Unleaded Octane 92

BRAND -HEATING OIL

TRANSPORT #2 Heating Oil 3.2110 * 0.0595
TRANSPORT #2 Heating Oil 80/20 No Bid 0.0595
TRANSPORT #2 Heating Oil 70/30 No Bid 0.0595
Tank Wagon #2 Heating Oil No Bid No Bid
Tank Wagon #2 Heating Qil 80/20 No Bid No Bid
Tank Wagon #2 Heating Oil 70/30 No Bid No Bid
ADDITIVE #2 Heating Oil

Mixing Ratio .0 0.03

'BRAND - DIESEL

TRANSPORT B-2 Bio-diesel 3.2935 * 0.0595
Tank Wagon B-2 Bio-diesel 3.4855 * 0.1995
ADDITIVE B-2 Bio-diesel

Mixing Rati 0.03 = 0.03

NRLM

TRANSPORT NRLM No Bid 0.0595

Tank Wagon NRLM 3.499 * 0.1995
{ A_ (




BERKS COUNTY JOINT PURCHASING BOARD

7/1/12 - 06/30/13 FUEL BID TALLY SHEET - Open and Award January 12, 2012

BRAND -HEATING OIL

NYMEX +
Petroleum Richland Partners RKA
Hess ISObunkers | Mansfield Oil Traders LLC d/b/a Leffler |  Petroleum | Talley Petroleum
VENDOR Corporation LLC Company Corporation Energy Company Enterprises, inc.
BRAND - GASOLINE
TRANSPORT Differential Price No Bid 0.2250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tank Wagon Differential Price No Bid 0.4375 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Added cost for 89 Octane over
87 Octane No Bid 0.0700 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Added cost for 92 Octane over
87 Octane No Bid 0.2000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

TRANSPORT #2 Heating Oil -

BRAND - DIESEL

Differential Price 0.1034 0.1650 No Bid 0.1852 No Bid No Bid No Bid
TRANSPORT Added cost for 80/20 0.1334 0.0480 No Bid 0.2852 No Bid No Bid No Bid
TRANSPORT Added cost for 70/30 0.1434 0.0880 No Bid 0.3352 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tank Wagon #2 Heating Oil -

Differential Price No Bid 0.4175 * No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tank Wagon Added cost for 80/20 No Bid 0.0800 * No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tank Wagon Added cost for 70/30 No Bid 0.1220 * No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ADDITIVE #2 Heating Oil 0.0375 * 0.0250

Mixing Ratio 0.0300 1:2000 N 1:1000 No Bid No Bid No Bid

TRANSPORT B-2

Differential Price 0.2987 0.2550 No Bid 0.2427 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tank Wagon B-2

Differential Price No Bid 0.5275 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ADDITIVE for Diesel Fuel for

0 Degree Weather 0.0300 0.0375 No Bid 0.0250 No Bid No Bid No Bid

(




ﬂamr VENDOR LIST

Hess Coirporation

Chris Pietrowski

867 Berkshire Blvd, Suite 201
Wyomissing, PA 19610
Phone: 610-371-2005

Fax: 610-378-7990

Richland Partners LI.C
d/b/a Leffler Energy
Dale Bischoft-Dely

15 Mount Joy Street
PO Box 302

Mount Joy, PA 17552
Phone: 717-653-1411
Fax: 717-653-9201

ISObunkers LLC
Charles Joanedis

2 New Road, Suite 311
Aston, PA 19014
Phone: 610-361-8000
Fax: 610-361-8924

RKA Petroleum Companies
Christina Nasser

28340 Wick road

Romulus, MI 48174

Phone: 734-946-2199

Fax: 734-531-2303

Mansfield Oil Company
Julie Tittle

1025 Airport Parkway SW
Gainsville, GA 30501-6833
Phone: 800-695-6626

Fax: 678-450-2242

Talley Petroleum Enterprises, Inc.

Allen Talley

10046 Allentown Boulevard

Grantville, PA 17028-8712
Phone: 800-942-9711
Fax: 717-469-7727

Petroleum Traders Corporation
Gayle Newton

7120 Pointe [nverness Way

Ft. Wayne, IN 46804-7928
Phone: 800-348-3705

Fax:  260-207-6347




