RESOLUTION NO. 2020-3

WHEREAS, the Board of Supervisors of the Township of Tulpehocken, Berks County,
Pennsylvania,

NOW, THEREFORE, the Board of Supervisors of the Township of Tulpehocken, Berks
County, Pennsylvania, hereby Resolves as follows:

To award contract(s) for the purchase of the following items through Berks County Joint

Purchasing: See attached Fuel Bid Tally Sheets

ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of Tulpehocken Township this 12" day of February,

2020.
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7/1/20 - 6/30/21 FUEL BID TALLY SHEET - Open and Award January 30, 2020

BERKS COUNTY JOINT PURCHASING BOARD

Talley Petroleum

VENDOR PAPCO, Ine. Petroleum Traders Corportation Enterprises, Inc.
FIRM PRICING FIRM PRICING FIRM PRICING
PER GALLON PER GALLON PER GALLON
BRAND - GASOLINE 12 MONTHS 12 MONTHS 12 MONTHS

TRANSPORT Unleaded Octane 87 1.5140 *1.4936 1.5040

Tank Wagon Unleaded Octane 87 1.7291 No Bid *1,7239
Tank Wagon Unleaded Octane 89 1.8264 No Bid *1.7720
Tank Wagon Cn_omam.g Octane 92 1.9976 No Bid *1.9473

BRAND -HEATING OIL

TRANSPORT #2 Heating Oil 1.7779 1.7874 *1.7563
Tank Wagon #2 Heating Oil *2.0587 No Bid 2.2341

Aditive Price #2 Heating Oil *0.0345 0.0250 *0.0350
Mixing Ratio #1:3000 1:7500 #1:3000

BRAND - DIESEL
TRANSPORT B-2 Bio-diesel 1.7620 1.7813 *“1.7517
Tank Wagon B-2 Bio-diesel 1.9372 No Bid *1.9216
Additive Price B-2 Bio-diesel 0.0345 0.0250 *0.0350
Mixing Ratio 1:3000 1:7500 *] "mocc,
NRLM
Tank Wagon NRLM *2.5097 No Bid 4.2758
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7/1/20 - 6/30/21 FUEL BID TALLY SHEET - Open and Award January 30, 2020

Petroleum Traders

Talley Petroleum Enterprises,

VENDOR PAPCO, Inc, Corportation Inc.
NYMEX + PRICING NYMEX + PRICING NYMEX + PRICING
BRAND - GASOLINE 12 MONTHS 12 MONTHS 12 MONTHS
TRANSPORT Differential Price 0.0286 -0.0066 0.0441
Tank Wagon Differential Price 0.2425 No Bid 0.2354
Added cost for 89 Octane over 87
Octane 0.0975 No Bid 0.0481
Added cost for 92 Octane over 87
QOctane 0.2685 No m.a 0.2229
BRAND -HEATING OIL

TRANSPORT #2 Heating Oil -

Differential Price 0.0875 0.0666 0.0713
Tank Wagon #2 Heating Oil -

Differential Price 0.3595 No Bid 0.5487
Aditive Price #2 Heating Oil 0.0345 0.0250 0.0350
Mixing Ratio 1:3000 1:7500 1:3000

BRAND - DIESEL

TRANSPORT B-2

Differential Price 0.0797 0.0685 0.0727
Tank Wagon B-2

Differential Price 0.2495 No Bid 0.2507
Additive Price B-2 Bio-diesel 0.0345 0.0250 0.0350
Mixing Ratio

NRLM
Tank Wagon NRLM 0.8150 No Bid 2.5976
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BERKS COUNTY JOINT PURCHASING BOARD
7/1/20 - 6/30/21 FUEL BID TALLY SHEET - Open and Award January 30, 2020

PATRICIPATING VENDOR LIST

PAPCO, Inc. Petroleum Traders Corportation Talley Petroleum Enterprises, Inc.
Gary Kligos Linda Stephens Adam Kovacs

2 New Road, Suite 311 7120 Pointe Inverness Way 10046 Allentown Boulevard
Aston, PA 19014 Fort Wayne, IN 46804 Grantville, PA 17028-8712
Phone: 610-361-8000 Phone: 888-637-7661 Phone: 800-942-9711

Fax: 610-361-8924 Fax: 260-203-3820 Fax: 717-469-7727
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