RESOLUTION NO. 2019-5

WHEREAS, the Board of Supervisors of the Township of Tulpehocken, Berks County,
Pennsylvania,

NOW, THEREFORE, the Board of Supervisors of the Township of Tulpehocken, Berks
County, Pennsylvania, hereby Resolves as follows:

To award contract(s) for the purchase of the following items through Berks County Joint

Purchasing: See attached Fuel Bid Tally Sheets

ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of Tulpehocken Township this 7" day of January,
2019.

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF TULPEHOCKEN
TOWNSHIP, BERKS COUNTY, PENNSYLVANIA
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BERKS COUNTY JOINT PURCHASING BOARD

7/1/19 - 6/30/20 FUEL BID TALLY SHEET - Open and Award December 18, 2018

BRAND -HEATING OIL

VENDOR Mansfield Oil Company PAPCO, Inc. Talley Petroleum Enterprises, Inc.
OPTION A OPTION B OPTION A OPTION B OPTION A OPTION B

FIRM FIRM FIRM FIRM FIRM FIRM

BRAND - GASOLINE 6 MONTHS 12 MONTHS 6 MONTHS 12 MONTHS 6 MONTHS 12 MONTHS
TRANSPORT Unleaded Octane §7 0.0193 1.4827 *1.5197 1.5409
Tank Wagon Unleaded Octane 87 No Bid 1.6729 *1.7394 1.7992
Tank Wagon Unleaded Octanc 89 No Bid 1.7506 s1iR121 1.9024
Tank Wagon Unleaded Octane 92 No Bid 1.8868 *1.9478 2.0221

BRAND - DIESEL

TRANSPORT #2 Heating Oil 0.0278 1.9274 1.9252 *1.8877
Tank Wagon #2 Heating Oil No Bid 2.1459 *2.1662 2.9973
Aditive Price #2 Heating Oil 0.0250 0.0350 #(.0350 *0.0350
Mixing Ratio 1:3000 1:3000 *1:3000 *1:3000

NRLM

TRANSPORT B-2 Bio-diesel 0.0282 1.8899 1.9069 *1.9064
Tank Wagon B-2 Bio-diesel No Bid 2.0768 2.0942 *2.0898
Additive Price B-2 Bio-diesel 0.0250 0.0325 0.0325 *0.0350
Mixing Ratio 1:3000 1:3000 1:3000 *1:3000

Tank Wagon NRLM

No Bid

2.685

*2.6948

2.9899
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BERKS COUNTY JOINT PURCHASING BOARD

7/1/19 - 6/30/20 FUEL BID TALLY SHEET - Open and Award December 18, 2018

Talley Petroleum

VENDOR Mansfield O1l Company PAPCO, Inc. Enterprises, Inc.
NYMEX + NYMEX + NYMEX +
BRAND - GASOLINE 12 MONTHS 12 MONTHS 12 MONTHS
TRANSPORT Differential Price 0.1447 -0.0203 -0.0069
Tank Wagon Differential Price No Bid 0.1994 0.1541
Added cost for 89 Octane over 87
Octane No Bid 0.0727 0.0721

Added cost for 92 Octane over 87
Octane

No Bid 0.2084 0.1399

BRAND -HEATING OIL
TRANSPORT #2 Heating Oil -

Differential Price 0.1866 0.0768 0.0373
Tank Wagon #2 Heating Oil -

Differential Price No Bid 03178 0.9877
Aditive Price #2 Heating Qil 0.0250 0.0350 0.0350

Mixing Ratio

BRAND - DIESEL
TRANSPORT B-2

Differential Price 0.2053 0.0731 0.0442
Tank Wagon B-2
Differential Price No Bid 0.2604 0.2276
Additive Price B-2 Bio-diesel 0.0250 0.0325 0.0350
Mixing Ratio o

NRLM
Tank Wagon NRLM No Bid 0.7500 0.9793
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BERKS COUNTY JOINT PURCHASING BOARD
7/1/19 - 6/30/20 FUEL BID TALLY SHEET - Open and Award December 18,2018

PATRICIPATING VENDOR LIST

Mansfield Qil Company PAPCQ, Inc. Talley Petroleum Enterprises, Inc.
Josh Epperson Gary Kligos J. Allen Talley

1025 Airport Parkway SW 2 New Road, Suite 311 10046 Allentown Boulevard
Gainesville, GA 30501-6813 Aston, PA 19014 Grantville, PA 17028-8712
Phone: 800-255-6699 Phone: 610-361-8000 Phone: 8§00-942-9711

Fax: 678-450-2242 Fax: 610-361-8924 Fax:  717-469-7727

Page 3 of 3




