RESOLUTION NO. 2018-6

WHEREAS, the Board of Supervisors of the Township of Tulpehocken, Berks County,
Pennsylvania,

NOW, THEREFORE, the Board of Supervisors of the Township of Tulpehocken, Berks
County, Pennsylvania, hereby Resolves as follows:

To award contract(s) for the purchase of the following items through Berks County Joint

Purchasing: See attached Fuel Bid Tally Sheets

ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of Tulpehocken Township this 13" day of June,
2018.

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF TULPEHOCKEN
TOWNSHIP, BERKS COUNTY, PENNSYLVANIA

b Mom &Q,/tv

Chairm

Attest: [4'1 y}q é% i 224 1_242 g’k
Secretary




BERKS COUNTY JOINT PURCHASING BOARD

7/1/18-6/30/19 FUEL BID TALLY SHEET - Open and Award April 12, 2018

VENDOR Lykins Energy Solutions PAPCO
OPTION A OPTIONB | OPTIONC | OPTION A OPTION B OPTION C
FIRM FIRM FIRM FIRM FIRM FIRM
BRAND - GASOLINE 3 MONTHS | 6 MONTHS |12 MONTHS| 3 MONTHS | 6 MONTHS | 12 MONTHS

TRANSPORT Unleaded Octane 87 2.1212 2.0446 2.0569 1.9287 1.8539 1.8652
Tank Wagon Unleaded Octane 87 No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.1198 2.0450 2.0438
Tank Wagon Unleaded Octane 89 No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.1983 2.1234 2,1222
Tank Wagon Unleaded Octane 92 No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.3296 2.2548 2.2685

BRAND -HEATING OIL

TRANSPORT #2 Heating Oil 2.2432 2.2402 22198 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tank Wagon #2 Heating Oil No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Aditive Price #2 Heating Oil 0.0250 0.0250 0.0250 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mixing Ratio 1:3000 1:3000 1:3000 No Bid No Bid No Bid

BRAND - DIESEL

TRANSPORT B-2 Bio-diesel 2.2621 2.2591 2.2387 21211 2.1185 2.0962
Tank Wagon B-2 Bio-diesel No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.3120 2.3088 2.2871
Additive Price B-2 Bio-diesel 0.0250 0.0250 0.0250 0.0345 0.0345 0.0345

1:3000 1:3000 1:3000 1:3000 1:3000 1:3000

Mixing Ratio

NRLM

Tank Wagon NRLM

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Page 1 of 3




BERKS COUNTY JOINT PURCHASING BOARD

7/1/18-6/30/19 FUEL BID TALLY SHEET - Open and Award April 12, 2018

Tank Wagon Unleaded Octane 92

BRAND -HEATING OIL

VENDOR Petroleum Traders Corporation Talley Petroleum Enterprises, Inc.
OPTION A OPTIONB | OPTIONC OPTION A OPTION B OPTION C
FIRM FIRM FIRM FIRM FIRM FIRM
BRAND - GASOLINE 3MONTHS | 6 MONTHS |12 MONTHS| 3 MONTHS | 6 MONTHS | 12 MONTHS
TRANSPORT Unleaded Octane 87 1.9458 1.9010 1.8892 No Bid No Bid 1.8693
Tank Wagon Unleaded Octane 87 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.4789
Tank Wagon Unleaded Octane 89 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.4591
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.4563

TRANSPORT #2 Heating Oil No Bid 2.0916 2.1078 No Bid 2.0796
Tank Wagon #2 Heating Oil No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.4520
Aditive Price #2 Heating Qil 0.0250 No Bid 0.0325

Mixing Ratio

TRANSPORT B-2 Bio-diesel 2:1527 2.1477 2.1384 No Bid No Bid 2.0837
Tank Wagon B-2 Bio-diesel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.1261
Additive Price B-2 Bio-diesel 0.0250 0.0250 0.0250 No Bid No Bid 0.0325
Mixing Ratio 1:7500 1:7500 1:7500 No Bid No Bid 1:3000

NRLM
Tank Wagon NRLM No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.4547
FUEL VENDOR LIST
Lynkins Energy Solutions PAPCO, Inc. Petroleum Traders Corporation
Greg Belisle Gary Kligos Joseph Vanderpool
5163 Wolfpen Pleasant Hill Road 2 New Road, Suite 311 7120 Pointe Inverness Way

Milford, Ohio 45150
Phone: 513-965-6262
Fax: 513-831-1428

Talley Petroleum Enterprises, Inc.
J. Allen Talley

10046 Allentown Boulevard
Grantville, PA 17028-8712
Phone: 800-942-9711

Fax: 717-469-7727

Fax:

Aston, PA 19014
Phone: 610-361-8000
610-361-8924

Fort Wayne, IN 46804
Phone: 800-348-3705 x1002

Fax:
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BERKS COUNTY JOINT PURCHASING BOARD

7/1/18-6/30/19 FUEL BID TALLY SHEET - Open and Award April 12,2018

No Bid

VENDOR Lykins Energy Solution PAPCO Petroleum Traders Corportation |  Talley Petroleum Enterprises, Inc.
OPTION A OPTION B OPTION A OPTION B OPTION A OPTION B OPTION A OPTIONB
NYMEX + NYMEX + NYMEX + NYMEX + NYMEX + NYMEX + NYMEX + NYMEX +
BRAND - GASOLINE 9 MONTHS 6 MONTHS 9 MONTHS 6 MONTHS 9 MONTHS | 6 MONTHS 9 MONTHS 6 MONTHS
TRANSPORT Differential Price 0.1788 0.1788 -0.0243 -0.0243 -0.0213 -0.0143 -0.0310 No Bid
Tank Wagon Differential Price No Bid No Bid 0.1643 0.1643 No Bid No Bid 0.5715 No Bid
Added cost for 89 Octane over §7
Octane No Bid No Bid 0.2478 0.2478 No Bid No Bid -0.0200 No Bid
Added cost for 92 Octane over 87
Octane No Bid No Bid 0.4091 0.4191 No Bid -0.0225 No Bid

BRAND -HEATING OIL

TRANSPORT #2 Heating Oil -

Differential Price 0.1821 0.1821 No Bid No Bid 0.0543 0.0503 0.0439 No Bid
Tank Wagon #2 Heating Oil -

Differential Price No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.1239 No Bid
Aditive Price #2 Heating Oil 0.0250 0.0250 No Bid No Bid 0.0250 0.0250 0.0325 No Bid
Mixing Ratio 1:7500 1:7500 No Bid No Bid

TRANSPORT B-2

Differential Price 0.1810 0.1810 0.0637 0.0665 0.0733 0.0723 0.0491 No Bid
Tank Wagon B-2

Differential Price No Bid No Bid 0.2545 0.2572 No Bid No Bid 0.0927 No Bid
Additive Price B-2 Bio-diesel 0.0250 0.0250 0.0345 0.0345 0.0250 0.0250 0.0325 No Bid

Mixing Ratio

NRLM

Tank Wagon NRLM

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

0.4213

No Bid
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