RESOLUTION NO. 2016-12

WHEREAS, the Board of Supervisors of the Township of Tulpehocken, Berks County,
Pennsylvania,
NOW, THEREFORE, the Board of Supervisors of the Township of Tulpehocken, Berks

County, Pennsylvania, hereby Resolves as follows:

To award contract(s) for the purchase of the following items through Berks County Joint

Purchasing: See attached Fuel Bid Tally Sheets

ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of Tulpehocken Township this 14" day of

December, 2016.

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF TULPEHOCKEN
TOWNSHIP, BERKS COUNTY, PENNSYLVANIA

}JMGMJV

Chairman

Attest: K%M%/k %/ZMUM

Secretary




BERKS COUNTY JOINT PURCHASING BOARD

7/1/17 - 6/30/18 FUEL BID TALLY SHEET - Open and Award November 9, 2016

BRAND -HEATING OIL

VENDOR PAPCOQO, Inc. Petroleum Traders Corportation | Talley Petroleum Enterprises Inc.

FIRM OPIS + Weekly FIRM OPIS + Weekly FIRM OPIS + Weekly

Sinking Spring Sinking Spring Sinking Spring
BRAND - GASOLINE Various Unbranded Sunoco
TRANSPORT Unleaded Octane 87 1.4959 -0.0060 1.5095 0.0043 1.4762 * -0.0251
TRANSPORT Unleaded Octane 89 1.6220 -0.0068 1.6249 -0.0308 1.5689 * -0.0360
TRANSPORT Unleaded Octane 92 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.7595 * -0.0392
Tank Wagon Unleaded Octane 87 L7122 0.2230 No Bid No Bid 1.6785 * 0.1772
Tank Wagon Unleaded Octane 89 1.7928 0.1832 No Bid No Bid 1.7712 * 0.1663
Tank Wagon Unleaded Octane 92 1.9729 0.1832 No Bid No Bid 1.9533 * 0.1546

BRAND - DIESEL

TRANSPORT #2 Heating Oil No Bid 0.0400 1.7070 0.0358 1.6350 -0.0093
TRANSPORT #2 Heating Oil 80/20 No Bid 0.1599 No Bid No Bid 1.7250 * No Bid
TRANSPORT #2 Heating Oil 70/30 No Bid 0.2599 No Bid No Bid 1.7700 * No Bid
Tank Wagon #2 Heating Oil No Bid 0.2695 No Bid No Bid 1.8373 * 0.1930
Tank Wagon #2 Heating Oil 80/20 No Bid 0.3595 No Bid No Bid 1.9273 0.2930
Tank Wagon #2 Heating Oil 70/30 No Bid 0.4995 No Bid No Bid 1.9673 0.3300
ADDITIVE #2 Heating Qil .0395 0395 .0350 .0350 0250 .0250

Mixing Ratio 1:2000 1:2000 1:7500 1:7500 1:3000 1:3000

TRANSPORT B-2 Bio-diesel 1.6558 0.0027 1.7045 0.0207 1.6463 * -0.0168

Tank Wagon B-2 Bio-diesel 1.8703 0.2293 No Bid No Bid 1.8702 0.1855

ADDITIVE B-2 Bio-diesel .0395 .0395 0350 L0350 0250 * 0250

Mixing Ratio 1:2000 1:2000 1:7500 1:7500 1:3000 1:3000
NRLM

TRANSPORT NRLM No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.6822 * -0.0166

Tank Wagon NRLM No Bid 0.6985 No 8id No Bid 1.8827 * U.1832




BERKS COUNTY JOINT PURCHASING BOARD

7/1/17 - 6/30/18 FUEL BID TALLY SHEET - Open and Award November 9, 2016

NYMEX +

BRAND -HEATING OIL

Petroleum Talley
East River James River Traders Petroleum
VENDOR Energy, Inc. | Guttman Energy Solutions Mansfield PAPCO, Inc. Corporation | Enterprises, Inc.
BRAND - GASOLINE
TRANSPORT Differential Price No Bid No Bid 0.0650 No Bid 0.0034 -0.0136 -0.0069
Tank Wagon Differential Price No Bid No Bid 0.1650 No Bid 02197 No Bid 0.1954
Added cost for 89 Octane over
87 Octane No Bid No Bid (0.3500 No Bid 0.1091 0.1154 0.0927
Added cost for 92 Octane over
87 Octane No Bid No Bid 0.6800 No Bid 0.2833

TRANSPORT #2 Heating Oil -

Differential Price No Bid 0.0160 0.0870 No Bid No Bid 0.1139 0.0584

TRANSPORT Added cost for 80/20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.1584

TRANSPORT Added cost for 70/30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.1984

Tank Wagon #2 Heating Oil -

Differential Price No Bid No Bid 0.1580 No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.2607

Tank Wagon Added cost for 80/20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.3607

Tank Wagon Added cost for 70/30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.4007

ADDITIVE #2 Heating Oil 0.0350 0.0250

Mixing Ratio No Bid 0.0250 0.0200 No Bid No Bid 1:7500 1:3000
BRAND - DIESEL

TRANSPORT B-2

Differential Price No Bid 0.0970 0.0870 No Bid 0.0764 0.1239 0.0773

Tank Wagon B-2

Differential Price - No Bid No Bid 0.1580 No Bid 0.2909 Nc Bid 0.3012

ADDITIVE for Diesel Fuel for 0.0350

0 Degree Wer*her No Bid 0.0250 S 1200 No Bid 0.0395 1:7500 0.0250

~
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FUEL VENDOR LIST

East River Energy, Inc.
Donald M. Herzog

401 Soundview Road
PO Box 388
Guilford, CT 06437
Phone: 800-336-3762
Fax: 203-453-3899

Mansfield Oil Company
David Zarfoss

1025 Airport parkway, SW
Gainesville, GA 30501-6813
Phone: 800-255-6699

Fax: 678-450-2242

Talley Petroleum Enterprises, Inc.

I. Allen Talley

10046 Allentown Boulevard
Grantville, PA 17028-8712
Phone: 800-942-9711

Fax: 717-469-7727

Guttman Energy

Lisa Dochinez

200 Speers Street

Belle Vernon, PA 15012
Phone: 724-489-5145
Fax: 724-489-5134

PAPCO, Inc.

Gary Kligos

2 New Road, Suite 311
Aston, PA 19014
Phone: 610-361-8000
Fax: 610-361-8924

James River Solutions
Tracy Little

10487 Lakeridge Parkway
Ashland, VA 23005
Phone: 804-767-8170
Fax; 804-359-6307

Petroleum Traders Corporation
Linda Stephens

7120 Pointe Inverness Way
Fort Wayne, IN 46804

Phone: §00-348-3705 x1002
Fax:  260-203-3820




